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Yom Kippur Begins 
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Sukkot Begins 

7 8 9 10 11 
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Thanksgiving Day (Canada) 
Indigenous Peoples’ Day 

Columbus Day (U.S.) 
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Simchat Torah Begins 

15 16 17 18 
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Halloween 

 

 
 

        

 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 
 
10:30 Coffee Hour in the 
Bistro 
 
2:30 Crosswords w/ Cathy on 
3rd floor Seabreeze 

 
 
10:30am Nails with Desirae 
(will come to room) 
 
2:00 Concert w/ Rob Gioia in 
the Chapel 

 
 
 
10:30 Poker in the Bistro 
 
2:00 Meeting of the Minds 

 
10:30 Chair Yoga w/ Ellen on 
Channel 28 
 
2:00 Concert w/ Fred Vine 
Duo in Lobby (Elders should 
come w/ family or friends) 

 
 
 
 
10:00 Mass in the Chapel 
 
 

 
 
10:30 Bowling League on 2nd 
floor porch 
 
2:00 Bingo in the Bistro 

 
11:00 Euchre Club in the Bistro 
 
3:15 Book Club on 2nd floor 
porch 
 
6:30 German Dancers in the 
BKA 

 
 
11:00 Art w/ Stacy Maid on 
3rd Floor Seabreeze 
 
2:30 Crosswords w/ Cathy on 
3rd floor Seabreeze 

 
 
10:30 Beading with Desirae 
2nd floor porch 
 
 
2:00 Concert w/ Jim Carroll 
Duo in the Chapel 

 
 
10:30 Listening Club on 2nd 
floor porch 
 
2:30 Afternoon Movie on 2nd 
floor porch 

 
 
 
2:00 Concert w/ Tyler Waltner 
in Lobby (Elders should come 
w/ family or friends) 

 
 
 
10:00 Mass in the Chapel 
 
Sunday Social After Mass 
 

 
 
10:30 Bowling League on 2nd 
floor porch 
 
2:00 Bingo in the Bistro 

 
 
10:30 Passport Series:  A Trip 
to Egypt 
 
3:15 Book Club on 2nd floor 
porch 

 
 
10:30 Coffee Hour in the 
Bistro 
 
2:30 Crosswords w/ Cathy on 
3rd floor Seabreeze 

 
 
10:30am Nails with Desirae 
(will come to room) 
 
 
2:00 Concert w/ Jake the 
Bagpiper in the Chapel 

 
 
10-11 Baby Goat Visits in the 
Bistro 
 
 
2:30 Cooking Class on 3rd 
floor Seabreeze 

 
10:30 Chair Yoga w/ Ellen on 
Channel 28 
 
2:00 Concert w/ The Bradley 
Brothers in Lobby (Elders 
should come w/ family or 
friends) 

 
 
 
 
10:00 Mass in the Chapel 
 

 
 
10:30 Bowling League on 2nd 
floor porch 
 
1:00 Communion Service on 
3rd Floor Seabreeze 
 
2:00 Bingo in the Bistro 

 
 
11:00 Euchre Club in the 
Bistro 
 
3:15 Book Club on 2nd floor 
porch 

 
 
10:30 Coffee Hour in the 
Bistro 
 
2:30 Crosswords w/ Cathy on 
3rd floor Seabreeze 

 
 
10:30 Crafts with Desirae 2nd 
floor porch 
 
 
2:00 Concert w/ Jim Georger 
in the Chapel 

 
 
10:00 Blackjack in the Bistro 
 
10:45 Ceramics on 2nd floor 
Seneca 
 
2:30 Happy Hour in the Bistro 

 
 
 
2:00 Concert w/ Mike Sidoti in 
Lobby (Elders should come 
w/ family or friends) 

 
 
 
10:00 Mass in the Chapel 
 
Sunday Social After Mass 
 

 
 
10:30 Bowling League on 2nd 
floor porch 
 
2:00 Bingo in the Bistro 

 
 
10:30 On This Day…2nd floor 
porch 
 
3:15 Book Club on 2nd floor 
porch 

 
 
10:30 Coffee Hour in the 
Bistro 
 
2:30 Crosswords w/ Cathy on 
3rd floor Seabreeze 

 
 
10:30am Nails with Desirae 
(will come to room) 
 
 
2:00 Halloween Program in 
the BKA 

 
 
10:30 Scary Stories on 2nd 
floor porch 
 
2:00 Meeting of the Minds 

 

  Tim Anderson~ LE Advocate (697.6609)     Desirae Fields ~LE Care Partner (697.6499)    Matt Cotton ~Music Therapist (697.6818) 


